
[[A68118 BOSWORTH CO]] VOLVO EC340D 210255 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP420431
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: A68118 BOSWORTH CO

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC MAINPO BOX 4500WESTBROOK, MEUS  04098Contact: TODD PIERCEpierce@chadwick-baross.comT: (207)854-8411F: (207)854-8237
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil.

Depot: VOLVO0006Unique No: 10848729Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 30 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0006 [WUSCAR] 06072052 (Generated: 01/30/2024 14:26:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD PIERCE - VOLVO0006

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420431 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3549 --- --- ---Oil Hours 400 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 51 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 61 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 49 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.6 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 --- --- ---Copper ppm 19 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 75 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2145 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 78 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1224 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1053 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 93 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0006 [WUSCAR] 06072052 (Generated: 01/30/2024 14:26:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD PIERCE - VOLVO0006
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC340D 210255\Diesel Engine [VCP420431] 24 Jan 2024 @ 3549.0 hrs

