
[[X11086]] VOLVO EC250EL 310704 - LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP431866
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: X11086

POTLATCH810 WEST PINE STREETWARREN, ARUS  71671Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (870)226-2611F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. Pleasenote that this is a corrected copy fordata entry update for hours onunit.All component wear rates arenormal. There is a light concentrationof water present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: POTWARUnique No: 10849055Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 30 Jan 2024
Report Id: POTWAR [WUSCAR] 06072378 (Generated: 01/30/2024 23:41:26) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - POTWAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP431866 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6009 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 223 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.227 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 26 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 193 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 7 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 8 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 0 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 254 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 14 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: POTWAR [WUSCAR] 06072378 (Generated: 01/30/2024 23:41:29) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - POTWAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250EL 310704\Left Final Drive [VCP431866] 24 Jan 2024 @ 6009.0 hrs

