
[[D13254 WM FOND DU LA]] VOLVO L120H 632883 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP429548
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: D13254 WM FOND DU LA

ARING EQUIPMENT COMPANY INC - MAIN (MILWAUKEE)13001 W SILVERE SPRING DRBUTLER, WIUS  53007Contact: GLENN OTTENBACHERgottenbacher@aring.comT: (262)282-0715F: (262)781-5053
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0069Unique No: 10849233Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 31 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0069 [WUSCAR] 06072556 (Generated: 02/01/2024 02:18:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GLENN OTTENBACHER - VOLVO0069

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429548 VCP440570 VCP414088 VCP419547Sample Date 19 Jan 2024 20 Dec 2023 05 Oct 2023 12 Jun 2023Machine Hours 6719 6529 6027 5382Oil Hours 190 502 1632 490Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.9 12.5 11.8 13.0Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.0 9.7 8.0 9.5Oxidation (PA) % 79 84 92 93
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.3 0.6 0.5Nitration (PA) % 47 58 65 73Sulfation (PA) % 61 64 71 65Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.4 <1.0 0.5 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 6 10 9Sodium ppm 2 <1 2 3Potassium ppm 2 1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 9 13 16Copper ppm 0 <1 2 1Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 7 7 8 6Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 37 39 32 47Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1560 1553 1245 1742Magnesium ppm 480 468 336 533Zinc ppm 1058 1052 854 1120Phosphorus ppm 925 894 710 919Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 73 42 27 41

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0069 [WUSCAR] 06072556 (Generated: 02/01/2024 02:18:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GLENN OTTENBACHER - VOLVO0069
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632883\Diesel Engine [VCP429548] 19 Jan 2024 @ 6719.0 hrs

