
[TMR-OKEECHOBEE [660875]] 14700 VOLVO L150E 17719 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP437952
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 660875

TRADEMARK METALS RECYCLING - OKEECHOBEE9800 NE 128TH AVEOKEECHOBEE, FLUS  34972Contact: RYAN BOWDEN
T: (863)467-9810F: (863)467-9814
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: TRAOKEUnique No: 10849235Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 30 Jan 2024
Report Id: TRAOKE [WUSCAR] 06072558 (Generated: 02/01/2024 04:49:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOKE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437952 VCP412618 VCP422425 DJJ05276161Sample Date 24 Jan 2024 21 Jul 2023 11 May 2023 09 Jun 2021Machine Hours 22404 21427 1231 18789Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed N/ASample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.6 13.0 13.3 12.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.3 9.2 7.0 ---Oxidation (PA) % 79 95 96 87
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.7 0.7 1 0.5Nitration (PA) % 73 82 90 75Sulfation (PA) % 62 70 72 71Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 3 4 4Sodium ppm 2 2 4 2Potassium ppm 2 0 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 11 25 5Copper ppm <1 <1 2 3Lead ppm 3 3 13 2Tin ppm <1 <1 1 <1Aluminum ppm 3 2 <1 2Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 77 51 97 59Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1392 1635 1647 1644Magnesium ppm 485 522 547 521Zinc ppm 955 1097 985 1116Phosphorus ppm 814 896 784 908Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 132 43 109 103

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRAOKE [WUSCAR] 06072558 (Generated: 02/01/2024 04:49:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOKE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 14700 VOLVO L150E 17719\Diesel Engine [VCP437952] 24 Jan 2024 @ 22404.0 hrs

