
JOHN DEERE HP 77 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP437774
Oil Type: TRACTOR FLUID HYD 46
Job No:

MITCHELL & STARK CONSTRUCTION CO6001 Shirley StNAPLES, FLUS  34109Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (239)597-2165F: (239)566-7865
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of particulates present in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: MITNAPUnique No: 10849421Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Jan 2024
Report Id: MITNAP [WUSCAR] 06072744 (Generated: 02/01/2024 02:01:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - MITNAP

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437774 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2683 --- --- ---Oil Hours 2000 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 53.5 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 1.27 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Particles >4µm 9767 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 209 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 8 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/15/10 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1679 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 13 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 942 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 750 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MITNAP [WUSCAR] 06072744 (Generated: 02/01/2024 02:01:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - MITNAP
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	JOHN DEERE JOHN DEERE HP 77\Hydraulic System [VCP437774] 23 Jan 2024 @ 2683.0 hrs

