
[TMR-OKEECHOBEE [660874]] 463144 VOLVO L180H 4823 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP437423
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 660874

TRADEMARK METALS RECYCLING - OKEECHOBEE9800 NE 128TH AVEOKEECHOBEE, FLUS  34972Contact: RYAN BOWDEN
T: (863)467-9810F: (863)467-9814
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: TRAOKEUnique No: 10849950Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 30 Jan 2024
Report Id: TRAOKE [WUSCAR] 06073273 (Generated: 02/01/2024 02:02:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOKE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437423 VCP398429 VCP346675 VCP05397867Sample Date 24 Jan 2024 07 Mar 2023 22 Feb 2022 09 Nov 2021Machine Hours 15824 13615 9968 8791Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed N/ASample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.2 43.5 44.4 43.0
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 13 14 14 10Sodium ppm 6 <1 6 6Potassium ppm 1 2 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 119 78 22 26Copper ppm 2 3 9 44Lead ppm <1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 2 <1Chromium ppm 2 1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 2 2Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 2 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3730 4430 4014 3700Magnesium ppm 26 24 26 24Zinc ppm 1581 1715 1496 1512Phosphorus ppm 1298 1396 1273 1268Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 139 136 125 126

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRAOKE [WUSCAR] 06073273 (Generated: 02/01/2024 02:02:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOKE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 463144 VOLVO L180H 4823\Rear Axle [VCP437423] 24 Jan 2024 @ 15824.0 hrs

