
[[SWO-069182]] VOLVO A45G 352639 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP431084
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: SWO-069182

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10850154Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 31 Jan 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06073477 (Generated: 01/31/2024 18:10:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP431084 VCP429355 VCP414176 VCP410474Sample Date 24 Jan 2024 23 Oct 2023 07 Aug 2023 12 May 2023Machine Hours 5434 4956 4377 3923Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.21 7.23 7.32 7.34Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT NT NT NTPercentage Glycol % 44.2 44.0 43.8 43.8Freezing Point °C -21 -21 -19 -19
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal normal normalCoolant Color Yllow Yllow Yllow Yllow

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06073477 (Generated: 01/31/2024 18:10:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352639\Coolant [VCP431084] 24 Jan 2024 @ 5434.0 hrs

