
[[SW1029238 UPPER VAL]] VOLVO G930 41244 - BOGIE/CENTER RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP419431
Oil Type: TDTO FLUID SAE 20
Job No: SW1029238 UPPER VAL

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY3330 NORTH YELLOWSTONE HIGHWAYIDAHO FALLS, IDUS  83401Contact: JASON MERRILLjmerrill@arnoldmachinery.comT: (208)523-0822F: (208)523-9918
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)TDTO FLUID SAE 20.  Please confirm. All component wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0077Unique No: 10858217Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 01 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 06076126 (Generated: 02/01/2024 17:26:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON MERRILL - VOLVO0077

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP419431 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 7816 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 59.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 18 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 102 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2807 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1197 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1109 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 06076126 (Generated: 02/01/2024 17:26:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON MERRILL - VOLVO0077
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO G930 41244\Bogie/Center Right Final Drive [VCP419431] 24 Jan 2024 @ 7816.0 hrs

