
[[SW1029238 UPPER VAL]] VOLVO G930 41244 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP419426
Oil Type: SAE 80
Job No: SW1029238 UPPER VAL

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY3330 NORTH YELLOWSTONE HIGHWAYIDAHO FALLS, IDUS  83401Contact: JASON MERRILLjmerrill@arnoldmachinery.comT: (208)523-0822F: (208)523-9918
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0077Unique No: 10858218Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 02 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 06076127 (Generated: 02/02/2024 10:10:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON MERRILL - VOLVO0077

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP419426 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 7816 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 65.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 35 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 433 --- --- ---Copper ppm 53 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 27 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 5 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3340 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1401 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1151 --- --- ---Barium ppm 6 --- --- ---Boron ppm 113 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 06076127 (Generated: 02/02/2024 10:10:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON MERRILL - VOLVO0077
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO G930 41244\Rear Axle [VCP419426] 24 Jan 2024 @ 7816.0 hrs

