
[[28885 STONE RIDGE]] VOLVO A45G 352882 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP419428
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 85W140
Job No: 28885 STONE RIDGE

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY3330 NORTH YELLOWSTONE HIGHWAYIDAHO FALLS, IDUS  83401Contact: DAVE BOSTONdboston@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (208)523-9918
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0077Unique No: 10858219Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 02 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 06076128 (Generated: 02/02/2024 10:10:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE BOSTON - VOLVO0077

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP419428 VCP404197 VCP283936 ---Sample Date 15 Jan 2024 13 Mar 2023 22 Feb 2022 ---Machine Hours 3019 1862 400 ---Oil Hours 0 212 400 ---Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 133 233 48.4 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 8 23 56 ---Sodium ppm 0 4 9 ---Potassium ppm 2 <1 5 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 179 901 858 ---Copper ppm 2 19 84 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 1 0 ---Chromium ppm 3 14 10 ---Molybdenum ppm 20 20 17 ---Nickel ppm 2 8 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 2 11 11 ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 325 12 95 ---Magnesium ppm 53 4 5 ---Zinc ppm 190 43 231 ---Phosphorus ppm 1037 1168 2440 ---Barium ppm <1 0 0 ---Boron ppm 144 139 126 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 06076128 (Generated: 02/02/2024 10:10:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE BOSTON - VOLVO0077
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352882\Drop Box [VCP419428] 15 Jan 2024 @ 3019.0 hrs

