
[TMR-OKEECHOBEE [60849]] 434166 VOLVO L180H 4821 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP443271
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: 60849

TRADEMARK METALS RECYCLING - OKEECHOBEE9800 NE 128TH AVEOKEECHOBEE, FLUS  34972Contact: RYAN BOWDEN
T: (863)467-9810F: (863)467-9814
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: TRAOKEUnique No: 10858291Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 02 Feb 2024
Report Id: TRAOKE [WUSCAR] 06076200 (Generated: 02/08/2024 13:48:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOKE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443271 VCP412617 VCP408046 VCP406021Sample Date 23 Jan 2024 21 Jul 2023 01 May 2023 06 Apr 2023Machine Hours 15313 13817 13007 12758Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.1 26.8 28.7 27.5
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 11 4 3 3Sodium ppm 0 4 <1 2Potassium ppm 1 1 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 61 51 54 209Copper ppm 2 2 2 8Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 0 <1 0Chromium ppm <1 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm <1 0 0 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 64 69 67 76Magnesium ppm 2 <1 4 4Zinc ppm <1 0 <1 0Phosphorus ppm 172 210 189 193Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 90 97 86 81

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRAOKE [WUSCAR] 06076200 (Generated: 02/08/2024 13:48:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOKE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 434166 VOLVO L180H 4821\Transmission (Auto) [VCP443271] 23 Jan 2024 @ 15313.0 hrs

