
[[F02939]] VOLVO L90H 627137 - BOTTOM DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP426819
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: F02939

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC31 JAMES P. MURPHY INDUSTRIAL HWYWEST WARWICK, RIUS  02893Contact: NORMAN VINCENTnorman.vincent@chadwick-baross.comT: (401)328-6967F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you follow the  waterdrain-off procedure for thiscomponent.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thecooling system. Excessive free waterpresent. Water appears to be fromDEF. The condition of the fuel isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: CHAWESRIUnique No: 10858338Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 06 Feb 2024
Report Id: CHAWESRI [WUSCAR] 06076247 (Generated: 02/09/2024 08:20:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NORMAN VINCENT - CHAWESRI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426819 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 196 --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.36 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.010 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CHAWESRI [WUSCAR] 06076247 (Generated: 02/09/2024 08:20:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NORMAN VINCENT - CHAWESRI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 627137\Bottom Diesel Fuel [VCP426819] 29 Jan 2024 @ 196.0 hrs

