
[[0086]] VOLVO A25G 740098 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP439285
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: 0086

JON M HALL COMPANY1920 BOOTHE CIRCLE SUITE 110LONGWOOD, FLUS  32750Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (407)215-0410F: 
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is a highamount of particulates present in theoil. Elemental level of silicon (Si)above normal indicating ingress ofseal material. Viscosity of sampleindicates oil is within ISO 68 range,advise investigate. Confirm oil type.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid.

Depot: JONLONUnique No: 10858901Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 07 Feb 2024
Report Id: JONLON [WUSCAR] 06076810 (Generated: 02/08/2024 13:09:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - JONLON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439285 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 12847 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 63.55 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.60 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Particles >4µm 101156 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 16865 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 400 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/21/16 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 55 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 7 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 0 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 14 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 664 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 44 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 472 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 424 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 21 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JONLON [WUSCAR] 06076810 (Generated: 02/08/2024 13:09:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - JONLON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 740098\Hydraulic System [VCP439285] 24 Jan 2024 @ 12847.0 hrs

