
[[0086]] VOLVO A25G 740098 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP439290
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 0086

JON M HALL COMPANY1920 BOOTHE CIRCLE SUITE 110LONGWOOD, FLUS  32750Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (407)215-0410F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: JONLONUnique No: 10859298Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Feb 2024
Report Id: JONLON [WUSCAR] 06077207 (Generated: 02/03/2024 11:27:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - JONLON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439290 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 12847 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 62.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 59 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 9 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm <1 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 15 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 714 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 45 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 463 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 418 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 25 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JONLON [WUSCAR] 06077207 (Generated: 02/03/2024 11:27:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - JONLON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 740098\Wet Disc Brake [VCP439290] 24 Jan 2024 @ 12847.0 hrs

