
[[S50402451]] VOLVO L90H 625727 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP430625
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: S50402451

IAA - INSURANCE AUTO AUCTIONS - WESTCHESTER VC2 WESTBROOK CORPORATE CENTER STE. 5WESTCHESTER, ILUS  60154Contact: BILLY BUTLER
T: (404)275-6868F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: INSWESUnique No: 10859948Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 04 Feb 2024
Report Id: INSWES [WUSCAR] 06077857 (Generated: 02/04/2024 13:44:56) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: WEBCHECK IN IAASOUEAST - BILLY BUTLER - INSWES

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP430625 VCP405419 --- ---Sample Date 10 Jan 2024 09 Feb 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 6000 4059 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 48.1 46.3 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 12 12 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 4 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 55 33 --- ---Copper ppm <1 5 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 2 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3984 3880 --- ---Magnesium ppm 13 14 --- ---Zinc ppm 1612 1576 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1422 1235 --- ---Barium ppm 7 0 --- ---Boron ppm 137 123 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: INSWES [WUSCAR] 06077857 (Generated: 02/04/2024 13:44:59) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: WEBCHECK IN IAASOUEAST - BILLY BUTLER - INSWES
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 625727\Rear Axle [VCP430625] 10 Jan 2024 @ 6000.0 hrs

