
[[469737 WATER FRONT]] VOLVO A40G 342355 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP441648
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 469737 WATER FRONT

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. All other componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10859953Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 04 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06077862 (Generated: 02/04/2024 13:24:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441648 VCP449234 VCP302588 VCP282072Sample Date 30 Jan 2024 02 Jan 2024 21 Jan 2021 03 Sep 2020Machine Hours 7915 7884 5098 4547Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 254 252 120 103
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 23 18 6 29Sodium ppm 2 4 6 16Potassium ppm 3 <1 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 559 424 26 74Copper ppm 2 2 <1 1Lead ppm <1 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 29 23 6 24Chromium ppm 6 4 <1 2Molybdenum ppm 19 15 4 17Nickel ppm 1 <1 1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 6 5 <1 2Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 135 103 134 117Magnesium ppm 39 29 2 <1Zinc ppm 108 84 71 91Phosphorus ppm 1279 973 882 978Barium ppm 7 0 0 <1Boron ppm 169 130 116 84

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06077862 (Generated: 02/04/2024 13:24:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342355\Drop Box [VCP441648] 30 Jan 2024 @ 7915.0 hrs

