
[[G08340 SNOW SYSTEMS]] VOLVO L60H 623446 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP410747
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: G08340 SNOW SYSTEMS

HOFFMAN EQUIPMENT - DEPTFORD1330 HURFFVILLE ROADDEPTFORD, NJUS  08096Contact: TAMMY SANDORAtammy.sandora@hoffmanequip.comT: (856)227-6400F: (856)227-0046
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of contaminant entry. Weadvise that you check the fuelinjection system. Recommend drainfuel if not already done and flushbefore refilling with fuel.All metallevels are normal indicating nocorrosion in the system. Excessivefree water present. There is amoderate concentration of emulsifiedwater present in the fuel. Elementallevel of silicon (Si) above normal.Tests indicate water layer containsvolatiles and unknown chemicallyactive solvents. The fuel is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8880Unique No: 10861493Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 05 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8880 [WUSCAR] 06079402 (Generated: 02/06/2024 07:35:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAMMY SANDORA - VOLVO8880

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP410747 --- --- ---Sample Date 30 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 14 --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.191 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 33 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8880 [WUSCAR] 06079402 (Generated: 02/06/2024 07:35:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAMMY SANDORA - VOLVO8880
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 623446\Diesel Fuel [VCP410747] 30 Jan 2024 @ 14.0 hrs

