
[[SWA468048]] VOLVO L110G 8426 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP434457
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SWA468048

BLAZE CONSTRUCTION5640 ST JEAN STDETROIT, MIUS  48213Contact: DAVE WARDdward@blazecontracting.netT: (248)632-2317F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Sodium and/orpotassium levels remain high. Test forglycol is negative. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: BLADETUnique No: 10861612Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 07 Feb 2024
Report Id: BLADET [WUSCAR] 06079521 (Generated: 02/08/2024 10:40:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE WARD - BLADET

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP434457 VCP391460 VCP362600 VCP323902Sample Date 01 Feb 2024 20 Oct 2022 01 Apr 2022 13 Sep 2021Machine Hours 15905 14524 13974 13750Oil Hours 80 500 500 250Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed Not ChangdSample Status ATTENTION SEVERE ABNORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.8 13.7 12.4 13.3Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.3 12.9 10.9 ---Oxidation (PA) % 57 67 71 64
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.6 0.5 0.3Nitration (PA) % 51 101 86 63Sulfation (PA) % 52 61 61 56Glycol % NEG 0.10 NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 6 5 2Sodium ppm 195 937 401 200Potassium ppm 5 30 19 6
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 18 14 3Copper ppm <1 3 2 <1Lead ppm <1 3 1 0Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 2 4 4 1Chromium ppm 0 4 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 58 73 33 30Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 1 1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 <1Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1149 1197 1438 1301Magnesium ppm 932 922 731 615Zinc ppm 1226 1232 980 888Phosphorus ppm 1025 1008 900 743Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 11 0 27 29

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BLADET [WUSCAR] 06079521 (Generated: 02/08/2024 10:40:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE WARD - BLADET
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110G 8426\Diesel Engine [VCP434457] 01 Feb 2024 @ 15905.0 hrs

