
[[600188 WASTE MGMT]] VOLVO EC160E 310147 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP420778
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 600188 WASTE MGMT

PACWEST MACHINERY8207 SOUTH 216TH STREETKENT, WAUS  98032Contact: DAN SLAGLEdslagle@pacwestmachinery.comT: (206)482-4179F: (509)534-5286
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Confirmoil type. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO1271Unique No: 10862316Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 06080225 (Generated: 02/07/2024 14:31:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAN SLAGLE - VOLVO1271

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420778 VCP424168 VCP346237 VCP300196Sample Date 10 Jan 2024 21 Sep 2023 31 Mar 2023 16 Mar 2021Machine Hours 12402 12010 0 5652Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd N/A Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 333 332 305 265
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG 0.303 4.80Silicon ppm 3 1 7 4Sodium ppm 0 2 <1 1Potassium ppm 1 2 3 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 58 53 209 55Copper ppm <1 0 <1 <1Lead ppm <1 0 <1 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 <1 1 <1Chromium ppm 2 <1 4 1Molybdenum ppm <1 0 0 0Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 <1 3 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 45 57 87 3Magnesium ppm <1 <1 4 0Zinc ppm 13 30 62 15Phosphorus ppm 1124 1132 1050 514Barium ppm 0 0 2 0Boron ppm 167 213 141 77

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 06080225 (Generated: 02/07/2024 14:31:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAN SLAGLE - VOLVO1271
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC160E 310147\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP420778] 10 Jan 2024 @ 12402.0 hrs

