
[[661009]] PETERSON 6700B 31B-21-1214 - FLUID COUPLER

Sample No: VCP438298
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER TRANSMISSION OIL SAE 30
Job No: 661009

FORESTRY RESOURCES4353 MICHIGAN LINKFORT MYERS, FLUS  33916Contact: COREY MUELLER
T: (239)872-1856F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Additivelevels indicate the addition of adifferent brand, or type of oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: FORFORTFLUnique No: 10862330Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 Feb 2024
Report Id: FORFORTFL [WUSCAR] 06080239 (Generated: 02/07/2024 14:30:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: COREY MUELLER - FORFORTFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP438298 --- --- ---Sample Date 31 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 20531 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 91.2 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 1 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 8 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 255 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 14 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 467 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 450 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 3 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: FORFORTFL [WUSCAR] 06080239 (Generated: 02/07/2024 14:31:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: COREY MUELLER - FORFORTFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	PETERSON PETERSON 6700B 31B-21-1214\Fluid Coupler [VCP438298] 31 Jan 2024 @ 20531.0 hrs

