
[[SWO-069192]] VOLVO A60H 340044 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP446728
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SWO-069192

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Fuel content negligible.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The oil viscosity is lowerthan normal. The BN result indicatesthat there is suitable alkalinityremaining in the oil.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10863274Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 08 Feb 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06081183 (Generated: 02/08/2024 10:43:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP446728 VCP383715 VCP411751 VCP410186Sample Date 01 Feb 2024 21 Aug 2023 04 Aug 2023 11 May 2023Machine Hours 9302 8811 8791 8303Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 13.8 12.6 12.6Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.2 9.5 10.4 10.2Oxidation (PA) % 74 55 79 79
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.2 1 0.7Nitration (PA) % 44 43 63 63Sulfation (PA) % 59 50 64 63Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 30 10 87 24Sodium ppm 30 <1 0 3Potassium ppm 23 <1 10 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 8 58 26Copper ppm <1 <1 3 2Lead ppm 0 <1 5 1Tin ppm 0 <1 2 1Aluminum ppm 2 5 47 17Chromium ppm <1 <1 1 <1Molybdenum ppm 43 53 39 42Nickel ppm 0 <1 2 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 2 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 2 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1528 1120 1644 1718Magnesium ppm 493 763 465 514Zinc ppm 1036 1106 1029 1074Phosphorus ppm 816 963 874 875Barium ppm 5 0 2 0Boron ppm 63 12 33 44

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06081183 (Generated: 02/08/2024 10:43:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 340044\Diesel Engine [VCP446728] 01 Feb 2024 @ 9302.0 hrs

