
[[RS0036754]] VOLVO A30G 752104 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP431842
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: RS0036754

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY7950 PITTMAN AVEPENSACOLA, FLUS  32534Contact: HUGH DOBBSHDOBBS@COWIN.COMT: (850)479-3004F: (850)474-1602
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8247Unique No: 10863743Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 08 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8247 [WUSCAR] 06081652 (Generated: 02/08/2024 14:46:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUGH DOBBS - VOLVO8247

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP431842 VCP320071 VCP317521 ---Sample Date 31 Jan 2024 24 Aug 2021 28 Jul 2021 ---Machine Hours 4113 1027 968 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 105 108 56.8 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 6 3 5 ---Sodium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Potassium ppm 2 8 4 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 113 93 262 ---Copper ppm 8 5 24 ---Lead ppm 0 1 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 1 ---Aluminum ppm 2 0 0 ---Chromium ppm 1 2 7 ---Molybdenum ppm 4 2 17 ---Nickel ppm 0 2 3 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 3 5 24 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 532 170 715 ---Magnesium ppm 14 3 2 ---Zinc ppm 272 80 277 ---Phosphorus ppm 856 1077 1541 ---Barium ppm 6 0 2 ---Boron ppm 139 169 229 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8247 [WUSCAR] 06081652 (Generated: 02/08/2024 14:46:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUGH DOBBS - VOLVO8247
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752104\Front Axle [VCP431842] 31 Jan 2024 @ 4113.0 hrs

