
[[660738 DIPRO]] VOLVO L220H 3352 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP452289
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL WB102
Job No: 660738 DIPRO

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL ELZERMANpaul.elzerman@altaequipment.comT: (248)356-5200F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10863745Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 08 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06081654 (Generated: 02/08/2024 12:37:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP452289 VCP411899 VCP421775 ---Sample Date 24 Jan 2024 14 Aug 2023 21 Mar 2023 ---Machine Hours 8210 6368 4140 ---Oil Hours 4210 2000 4140 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.5 40.8 42.2 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 11 12 18 ---Sodium ppm 0 0 10 ---Potassium ppm 2 2 2 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 80 55 92 ---Copper ppm 4 2 5 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 2 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 3 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 1 5 ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm 1 1 6 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3055 3026 4027 ---Magnesium ppm 10 11 16 ---Zinc ppm 1437 1368 1687 ---Phosphorus ppm 1046 1209 1388 ---Barium ppm 5 0 0 ---Boron ppm 24 26 146 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06081654 (Generated: 02/08/2024 12:37:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3352\Rear Axle [VCP452289] 24 Jan 2024 @ 8210.0 hrs

