
[[SWO069093 CITY OF LA]] VOLVO EC480 314992 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP437804
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: SWO069093 CITY OF LA

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY INC - GUNTERSVILLE15101 ALABAMA HWY 20MADISON, ALUS  35756Contact: RANDY HARRISRHARRIS@COWIN.COMT: (256)298-2322F: (256)355-5250
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. Fuel contentnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: COWMADUnique No: 10869224Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 08 Feb 2024
Report Id: COWMAD [WUSCAR] 06081779 (Generated: 02/08/2024 12:39:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY HARRIS - COWMAD

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437804 --- --- ---Sample Date 19 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2030 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 81 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 70 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 60 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.7 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 47 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1740 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 443 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1131 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 974 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 38 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWMAD [WUSCAR] 06081779 (Generated: 02/08/2024 12:39:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY HARRIS - COWMAD
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480 314992\Diesel Engine [VCP437804] 19 Jan 2024 @ 2030.0 hrs

