
[[TRANSPORT LEASING]] VOLVO L220H 2280 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP429831
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: TRANSPORT LEASING

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY464 WASHINGTON STREET STWIN FALLS, IDUS  83301Contact: JANAE HYMASjhymas@arnoldmachinery.comT: (208)733-1715F: (775)356-7152
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Fuel content negligible.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO1835Unique No: 10869638Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 09 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO1835 [WUSCAR] 06082193 (Generated: 02/09/2024 08:41:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JANAE HYMAS - VOLVO1835

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429831 VCP368338 VCP371227 VCP402500Sample Date 26 Jan 2024 14 Nov 2023 10 Oct 2023 18 Apr 2023Machine Hours 22180 21662 21192 20706Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed N/A N/ASample Status MARGINAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 13.2 13.3 12.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.4 9.6 9.4 8.7Oxidation (PA) % 55 55 59 59
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.3 0.6 0.3Nitration (PA) % 53 51 61 62Sulfation (PA) % 50 52 54 53Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.4 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 3 3 4 2Sodium ppm 0 0 1 1Potassium ppm <1 1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 4 9 3Copper ppm 2 1 2 1Lead ppm 1 0 0 0Tin ppm 1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 3 1 2 2Chromium ppm <1 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm 66 62 62 66Nickel ppm 1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1104 1108 1146 1137Magnesium ppm 1010 918 971 944Zinc ppm 1294 1205 1298 1269Phosphorus ppm 1037 984 1062 1002Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 6 3 6 6

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1835 [WUSCAR] 06082193 (Generated: 02/09/2024 08:41:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JANAE HYMAS - VOLVO1835
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 2280\Diesel Engine [VCP429831] 26 Jan 2024 @ 22180.0 hrs

