
[[X59196]] VOLVO SDLG L959F 640017 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP440826
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: X59196

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Saint RosePO BOX 997SAINT ROSE, LAUS  70087Contact: DANA FOSHEEdfoshee@scottcompanies.comT: (504)461-0961F: (504)461-0970
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. We advise thatyou check all areas where dirt canenter the system. We recommendthat you drain the oil from thecomponent if this has not alreadybeen done. We advise that youinspect for the source(s) of wear.Please note that there was too muchwater present in the oil to perform aviscosity test.Bearing and/or gearwear is indicated. Appearance isunacceptable There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The oil isno longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: SCOSAIUnique No: 10870299Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 09 Feb 2024
Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06082854 (Generated: 02/09/2024 13:38:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440826 --- --- ---Sample Date 06 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2499 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 1508 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 40.7 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3294 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 29 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 66 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3184 --- --- ---Copper ppm 194 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm 22 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 592 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 29 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 40 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 31 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 6637 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 327 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 54 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 400 --- --- ---Barium ppm 16 --- --- ---Boron ppm 69 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06082854 (Generated: 02/09/2024 13:38:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO SDLG L959F 640017\Front Right Final Drive [VCP440826] 06 Feb 2024 @ 2499.0 hrs

