
[[X59174 S RECYCLING]] VOLVO EC250EL 314100 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP440827
Oil Type: VOLVO 80W140
Job No: X59174 S RECYCLING

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Saint RosePO BOX 997SAINT ROSE, LAUS  70087Contact: DANA FOSHEEdfoshee@scottcompanies.comT: (504)461-0961F: (504)461-0970
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Weadvise that you check for the sourceof water entry. The oil change at thetime of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Gear wear is indicated.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. There is amoderate concentration of waterpresent in the oil. The condition ofthe oil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: SCOSAIUnique No: 10870303Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 09 Feb 2024
Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06082858 (Generated: 02/09/2024 13:37:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440827 VCP407190 VCP379168 ---Sample Date 01 Feb 2024 15 Jun 2023 30 Aug 2022 ---Machine Hours 3516 2382 1707 ---Oil Hours 2000 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 339 331 302 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.853 NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 85 98 36 ---Sodium ppm 3 1 1 ---Potassium ppm 9 11 5 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1030 913 257 ---Copper ppm 2 2 <1 ---Lead ppm <1 1 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 19 19 6 ---Chromium ppm 16 19 6 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 3 1 ---Nickel ppm 1 2 <1 ---Titanium ppm 2 2 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 10 9 3 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 0 149 52 ---Magnesium ppm 8 5 <1 ---Zinc ppm 20 42 21 ---Phosphorus ppm 1091 1391 814 ---Barium ppm 6 7 0 ---Boron ppm 129 185 80 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06082858 (Generated: 02/09/2024 13:37:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250EL 314100\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP440827] 01 Feb 2024 @ 3516.4 hrs

