
VOLVO EC480EL 314321 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP404251
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No:

CITY OF WISCONSIN RAPIDS444 W GRAND AVEWISCONSON RAPIDS, WIUS  54495Contact: MARK MCAULEYmmcauley@wirapids.orgT: (715)421-8266F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval tomonitor.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate amount of silt (particulates< 14 microns in size) present in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: CITWISUnique No: 10870490Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 09 Feb 2024
Report Id: CITWIS [WUSCAR] 06083045 (Generated: 02/09/2024 14:14:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK MCAULEY - CITWIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP404251 VCP309697 VCP309971 VCP309684Sample Date 30 Jan 2024 28 Mar 2023 29 Oct 2021 22 Jun 2021Machine Hours 3036 2109 995 501Oil Hours 3036 0 995 501Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.2 40.6 41.7 42.6Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.41 0.43 0.398 0.480
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 43566 1410 3586 63949Particles >6µm 7356 242 123 3119Particles >14µm 388 11 6 18ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/20/16 18/15/11 19/14/10 23/19/11Silicon ppm 5 5 7 2Sodium ppm <1 0 1 0Potassium ppm 0 2 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 5 5 2Copper ppm 20 16 18 8Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 0 0 <1 0Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 14 8 4 2Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 2Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 118 132 242 98Magnesium ppm 7 10 22 11Zinc ppm 461 525 907 483Phosphorus ppm 383 414 731 363Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm <1 <1 9 4

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CITWIS [WUSCAR] 06083045 (Generated: 02/09/2024 14:14:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK MCAULEY - CITWIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 314321\Hydraulic System [VCP404251] 30 Jan 2024 @ 3036.0 hrs

