
VOLVO EC480EL 314321 - LEFT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP405284
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO GEAR ESI OIL 85W140
Job No:

CITY OF WISCONSIN RAPIDS444 W GRAND AVEWISCONSON RAPIDS, WIUS  54495Contact: MARK MCAULEYmmcauley@wirapids.orgT: (715)421-8266F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CITWISUnique No: 10870616Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 09 Feb 2024
Report Id: CITWIS [WUSCAR] 06083171 (Generated: 02/09/2024 14:14:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK MCAULEY - CITWIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP405284 VCP309692 VCP309955 VCP309509Sample Date 30 Jan 2024 28 Mar 2023 29 Oct 2021 22 Jun 2021Machine Hours 3036 2109 995 501Oil Hours 927 0 995 501Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 308 210 236 182
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 5 4 3 10Sodium ppm 0 0 <1 2Potassium ppm 3 2 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 85 75 81 210Copper ppm 2 2 5 12Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm <1 0 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 1 3Molybdenum ppm 36 216 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 1 1 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 6 6 2 5Magnesium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Zinc ppm 3 0 6 13Phosphorus ppm 1065 1164 1302 283Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 195 168 329 18

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CITWIS [WUSCAR] 06083171 (Generated: 02/09/2024 14:15:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK MCAULEY - CITWIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 314321\Left Swing Drive [VCP405284] 30 Jan 2024 @ 3036.0 hrs

