
[[20]] VOLVO L90H 25826 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP452146
Oil Type: MOBIL DELVAC 1300 SUPER15W40
Job No: 20

PLEASANT RIVER LUMBERPO BOX 68DOVER FOXCROFT, MEUS  04426Contact: BURLEY HIGGINSburley@pleasantriverlumber.comT: F: (207)564-8259
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: PLEDOVUnique No: 10873251Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 Feb 2024
Report Id: PLEDOV [WUSCAR] 06085806 (Generated: 02/13/2024 11:51:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURLEY HIGGINS - PLEDOV

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP452146 VCP406778 VCP405776 VCP324024Sample Date 25 Jan 2024 01 Sep 2023 13 Jun 2023 11 Apr 2023Machine Hours 7157 6073 5457 5012Oil Hours 800 500 450 350Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.2 13.3 12.9 12.9Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.1 9.2 9.5 8.4Oxidation (PA) % 87 65 57 54
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.6 0.3 0.2 0.1Nitration (PA) % 96 74 61 53Sulfation (PA) % 66 55 50 47Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 5 3 3Sodium ppm 2 2 2 1Potassium ppm 0 2 0 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 23 11 6 5Copper ppm 1 1 <1 0Lead ppm <1 1 0 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 4 2 3 0Chromium ppm <1 1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 69 75 62 60Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1172 1261 1085 1038Magnesium ppm 1047 1164 992 969Zinc ppm 1370 1486 1270 1284Phosphorus ppm 1118 1169 1036 1050Barium ppm 0 12 0 0Boron ppm 1 <1 2 3

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLEDOV [WUSCAR] 06085806 (Generated: 02/13/2024 11:51:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURLEY HIGGINS - PLEDOV
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 25826\Diesel Engine [VCP452146] 25 Jan 2024 @ 7157.0 hrs

