
[[12046]] VOLVO A35D 72314 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP443152
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: 12046

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Light fuel dilution occurring. Noother contaminants were detected inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10873262Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 14 Feb 2024
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06085817 (Generated: 02/14/2024 13:02:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443152 VCP418601 VCP386463 VCP358838Sample Date 06 Feb 2024 09 Jun 2023 21 Nov 2022 30 Sep 2022Machine Hours 11246 10992 10780 10575Oil Hours 0 0 250 250Oil Changed N/A N/A Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.2 12.9 13.0 12.2Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.8 8.4 10.0 11.1Oxidation (PA) % 71 56 58 78
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.5 0.5 1.3Nitration (PA) % 48 52 55 80Sulfation (PA) % 58 52 56 67Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 1.7 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 2 4 6Sodium ppm 2 1 <1 <1Potassium ppm 0 1 <1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 5 8 24Copper ppm 0 0 <1 2Lead ppm 0 0 <1 1Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm <1 10 1 2Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 40 46 42 47Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1549 1497 1470 1736Magnesium ppm 536 703 580 480Zinc ppm 1110 1237 1104 1103Phosphorus ppm 975 994 934 918Barium ppm 0 0 0 2Boron ppm 56 10 18 40

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06085817 (Generated: 02/14/2024 13:02:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35D 72314\Diesel Engine [VCP443152] 06 Feb 2024 @ 11246.0 hrs

