
[[SPM661220]] VOLVO L180H 5412 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP442816
Oil Type: VOLVO VDS-4.5 Premium Motor Oil 15W40
Job No: SPM661220

CALLANANRT 32 677 FLATBUSH RDEAST KINGSTON, NYUS  12401Contact: 
T: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: CALEASUnique No: 10873265Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 14 Feb 2024
Report Id: CALEAS [WUSCAR] 06085820 (Generated: 02/14/2024 13:32:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - CALEAS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP442816 VCP423025 VCP396097 VCP373356Sample Date 07 Feb 2024 30 Jun 2023 01 Feb 2023 18 Jun 2022Machine Hours 7046 5936 6657 4250Oil Hours 0 0 700 500Oil Changed N/A N/A Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 13.0 12.7 12.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.2 10.1 9.3 10.9Oxidation (PA) % 80 84 82 85
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.1 0.2Nitration (PA) % 56 51 67 65Sulfation (PA) % 61 63 61 63Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.8 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 3 4 4Sodium ppm 2 3 3 2Potassium ppm 0 2 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 3 6 6Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 2Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 1Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 39 38 41 40Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1635 1757 1705 1621Magnesium ppm 504 492 508 493Zinc ppm 1097 1137 1099 1149Phosphorus ppm 962 920 920 885Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 54 56 46 51

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CALEAS [WUSCAR] 06085820 (Generated: 02/14/2024 13:32:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - CALEAS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5412\Diesel Engine [VCP442816] 07 Feb 2024 @ 7046.0 hrs

