
[[12046]] VOLVO A35D 72314 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP443198
Oil Type: MOBIL HYDRAULIC OIL AW 46
Job No: 12046

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The condition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10873457Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 Feb 2024
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06086012 (Generated: 02/13/2024 12:55:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443198 VCP389232 VCP314075 VCP264187Sample Date 06 Feb 2024 30 Sep 2022 29 Jul 2021 30 Jan 2020Machine Hours 11246 10575 9836 8935Oil Hours 0 2000 1500 1000Oil Changed N/A Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 49.1 41.5 41.8 41.7Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.62 0.58 0.671 0.660
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 19998 47265 34606 14825Particles >6µm 1873 2842 907 583Particles >14µm 117 112 28 27ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/18/14 23/19/14 22/17/12 21/16/12Silicon ppm 9 8 7 6Sodium ppm 0 2 2 0Potassium ppm 2 0 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 9 9 8Copper ppm 9 8 7 6Lead ppm <1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 2 2 3 2Chromium ppm 3 4 3 2Molybdenum ppm 2 1 1 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 364 409 424 428Magnesium ppm 9 10 9 8Zinc ppm 679 757 721 732Phosphorus ppm 545 549 554 567Barium ppm 13 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 5 5

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06086012 (Generated: 02/13/2024 12:55:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35D 72314\Hydraulic System [VCP443198] 06 Feb 2024 @ 11246.0 hrs

