
[[A11995]] VOLVO EC220D 210516 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP408159
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 80W90
Job No: A11995

WASTE MANAGEMENT5245 BLEIGH AVEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19136Contact: JERRY SAUTERgsauterj@wm.comT: (610)636-4994F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: WASPHIUnique No: 10873744Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 13 Feb 2024
Report Id: WASPHI [WUSCAR] 06086299 (Generated: 02/13/2024 14:35:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JERRY SAUTER - WASPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP408159 VCP337112 VCP365725 VCP361453Sample Date 27 Jan 2024 07 Mar 2023 22 Nov 2022 14 Jul 2022Machine Hours 18920 17930 17630 17175Oil Hours 1000 1000 0 1000Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 298 296 296 297
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 3 2 2 2Sodium ppm 0 0 0 0Potassium ppm 0 1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 56 43 48 35Copper ppm 0 <1 0 0Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 0 1 0 0Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 0 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 39 40 39 30Magnesium ppm 2 5 0 2Zinc ppm 5 10 10 10Phosphorus ppm 970 867 910 718Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 219 161 218 171

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WASPHI [WUSCAR] 06086299 (Generated: 02/13/2024 14:35:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JERRY SAUTER - WASPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220D 210516\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP408159] 27 Jan 2024 @ 18920.0 hrs

