
[[12046]] VOLVO A35D 72314 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP443199
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD PLUS 85W140
Job No: 12046

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10873856Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 Feb 2024
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06086411 (Generated: 02/13/2024 18:42:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443199 VCP389237 VCP308461 VCP264183Sample Date 06 Feb 2024 30 Sep 2022 29 Jul 2021 30 Jan 2020Machine Hours 11246 10575 9836 8935Oil Hours 0 2000 1500 1000Oil Changed N/A Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 303 256 254 259
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 6 4 3 4Sodium ppm <1 2 2 1Potassium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 26 52 48 36Copper ppm <1 5 4 2Lead ppm 0 0 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 0Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 5 5 4Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 92 230 227 222Magnesium ppm 14 38 39 33Zinc ppm 45 129 122 106Phosphorus ppm 517 931 938 882Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 62 157 245 129

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06086411 (Generated: 02/13/2024 18:42:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35D 72314\Front Axle [VCP443199] 06 Feb 2024 @ 11246.0 hrs

