
[[SPM661220]] VOLVO L180H 5412 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP442817
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: SPM661220

CALLANANRT 32 677 FLATBUSH RDEAST KINGSTON, NYUS  12401Contact: 
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CALEASUnique No: 10873864Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 13 Feb 2024
Report Id: CALEAS [WUSCAR] 06086419 (Generated: 02/13/2024 11:33:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - CALEAS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP442817 VCP396103 VCP374137 VCP342752Sample Date 07 Feb 2024 01 Feb 2023 18 Jun 2022 08 Dec 2021Machine Hours 7046 6657 4250 3605Oil Hours 0 6657 0 3600Oil Changed N/A Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.4 39.8 39.5 40.2
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 15 15 15 15Sodium ppm 3 9 9 10Potassium ppm 0 <1 5 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 97 187 77 97Copper ppm 2 5 8 4Lead ppm 0 1 1 0Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm <1 <1 1 1Chromium ppm 2 5 3 3Molybdenum ppm 0 2 2 2Nickel ppm 0 2 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm 2 6 5 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3735 4091 3343 4107Magnesium ppm 16 20 14 17Zinc ppm 1525 1668 1325 1582Phosphorus ppm 1285 1232 1187 1311Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 136 139 123 149

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CALEAS [WUSCAR] 06086419 (Generated: 02/13/2024 11:33:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - CALEAS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5412\Rear Axle [VCP442817] 07 Feb 2024 @ 7046.0 hrs

