
[[X38207 TRI PARISH]] 353114 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP433060
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: X38207 TRI PARISH

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Baton Rouge10160 AIRLINE HWYBATON ROUGE, LAUS  70816Contact: TIM ARMANDtarmand@scottcompanies.comT: F: (225)292-9658
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateconcentration of water present in thefluid. Moderate concentration ofvisible dirt/debris present in the fluid.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6242Unique No: 10873902Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO6242 [WUSCAR] 06086457 (Generated: 02/13/2024 18:50:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TIM ARMAND - VOLVO6242

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP433060 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3748 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.5 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.447 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 24 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 91 --- --- ---Copper ppm 25 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 6 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 45 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 7 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 69 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 2 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 190 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 66 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6242 [WUSCAR] 06086457 (Generated: 02/13/2024 18:50:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TIM ARMAND - VOLVO6242
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 353114\Transmission (Auto) [VCP433060] 07 Feb 2024 @ 3748.0 hrs

