
[[X59203]] VOLVO L90H 624610 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP437153
Oil Type: ATF
Job No: X59203

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Saint RosePO BOX 997SAINT ROSE, LAUS  70087Contact: DANA FOSHEEdfoshee@scottcompanies.comT: (504)461-0961F: (504)461-0970
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: SCOSAIUnique No: 10873912Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 Feb 2024
Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06086467 (Generated: 02/13/2024 18:54:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437153 VCP379052 --- ---Sample Date 07 Feb 2024 27 Jun 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 8015 5210 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 26.0 26.0 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 12 11 --- ---Sodium ppm 12 8 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 119 97 --- ---Copper ppm 9 7 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 1 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 10 8 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 100 98 --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 53 45 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 166 159 --- ---Barium ppm 2 0 --- ---Boron ppm 44 56 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06086467 (Generated: 02/13/2024 18:54:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624610\Transmission (Auto) [VCP437153] 07 Feb 2024 @ 8015.0 hrs

