
[[458006]] VOLVO A45FS 352082 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP06086510
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 458006

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10873955Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 12 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06086510 (Generated: 02/12/2024 15:37:20) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP06086510 VCP300124 --- ---Sample Date 23 Jan 2024 19 May 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 4649 2030 --- ---Oil Hours 0 2030 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Changed --- ---Sample Status MARGINAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 263.7 49.0 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 24 4 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 1 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 120 341 --- ---Copper ppm <1 2 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 5 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 14 12 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 12 9 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 186 135 --- ---Magnesium ppm 40 1 --- ---Zinc ppm 102 61 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1073 2346 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 188 238 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06086510 (Generated: 02/12/2024 15:37:23) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45FS 352082\Front Axle [VCP06086510] 23 Jan 2024 @ 4649.0 hrs

