
VOLVO A30F 82299 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP454429
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No:

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: ROBERT TURNERrturner@ripatampa.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10875186Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 15 Feb 2024
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06087741 (Generated: 02/15/2024 11:04:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454429 VCP332174 VCP272220 VCP162725Sample Date 08 Feb 2024 20 Jan 2022 30 Mar 2020 01 Oct 2014Machine Hours 11488 10461 10028 1368Oil Hours 0 1500 2000 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 369 43.0 217 59.3
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm <1 16 15 5Sodium ppm 0 4 <1 2Potassium ppm 0 3 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 0 115 106 301Copper ppm 0 11 7 20Lead ppm 0 <1 0 0Tin ppm <1 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 0 1 <1 <1Chromium ppm 0 5 1 7Molybdenum ppm 0 4 1 0Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 4Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 0 10 1 13Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 48 4267 130 29Magnesium ppm <1 15 15 <1Zinc ppm 27 1754 104 12Phosphorus ppm 938 1412 856 1238Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 193 145 118 180

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06087741 (Generated: 02/15/2024 11:04:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT TURNER - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30F 82299\Rear Axle [VCP454429] 08 Feb 2024 @ 11488.0 hrs

