
VOLVO A30G RR1061-2 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP06087750
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

ROCRENTS EQUIPMENT610 SALT RDWEBSTER, NYUS  14580Contact: GARY RIVOLIoperations@rocrents.comT: (585)645-7044F: (877)618-7368
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of wear.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The iron levelis abnormal. The copper level issevere. There is a high concentrationof water present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: ROCWEBUnique No: 10875195Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 15 Feb 2024
Report Id: ROCWEB [WUSCAR] 06087750 (Generated: 02/15/2024 11:05:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GARY RIVOLI - ROCWEB

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP06087750 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 47.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 1.17 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 16 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 29 --- --- ---Copper ppm 368 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3276 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 21 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1165 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1013 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 112 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ROCWEB [WUSCAR] 06087750 (Generated: 02/15/2024 11:05:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GARY RIVOLI - ROCWEB
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G RR1061-2\Wet Disc Brake [VCP06087750] 12 Feb 2024 @ .0 hrs

