
[[SW1029866 HADCO CONS]] VOLVO EC200E 314315 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP440152
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: SW1029866 HADCO CONS

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: S. KARBACHskarbach@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. We advise that youcheck the air filter, air inductionsystem, and any areas where dirt mayenter the component. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. Sodiumand/or potassium levels are high.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The oilviscosity is higher than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 10876033Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 19 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06088588 (Generated: 02/20/2024 05:07:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: S. KARBACH - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440152 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2924 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 22.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 70.3 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 92 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.6 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 198 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 5 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 21 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1706 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 228 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 17 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 14 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 8 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 72 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1374 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 349 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1053 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 872 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 159 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06088588 (Generated: 02/20/2024 05:07:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: S. KARBACH - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC200E 314315\Diesel Engine [VCP440152] 08 Feb 2024 @ 2924.0 hrs

