
[[12058]] VOLVO A30D 12117 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP443155
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: 12058

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10876034Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 15 Feb 2024
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06088589 (Generated: 02/15/2024 15:52:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443155 VCP418606 VCP363762 VCP373620Sample Date 08 Feb 2024 09 Jun 2023 11 Aug 2022 09 Aug 2022Machine Hours 12796 12542 10465 10465Oil Hours 0 0 250 250Oil Changed N/A N/A Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.1 11.9 11.6 12.7Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.6 8.7 10.9 11.2Oxidation (PA) % 76 63 79 73
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.3 0.4Nitration (PA) % 51 53 63 53Sulfation (PA) % 59 53 63 61Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 2.6 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 2 5 5Sodium ppm 0 2 0 3Potassium ppm 1 1 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 5 11 12Copper ppm 2 0 2 2Lead ppm 0 0 <1 1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 10 3 <1Chromium ppm 0 0 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 37 29 50 47Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1517 1977 1645 1528Magnesium ppm 436 362 450 443Zinc ppm 1044 1114 1058 937Phosphorus ppm 930 915 910 762Barium ppm 12 0 0 <1Boron ppm 50 34 61 79

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06088589 (Generated: 02/15/2024 15:52:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30D 12117\Diesel Engine [VCP443155] 08 Feb 2024 @ 12796.0 hrs

