
[[12058]] VOLVO A30D 12117 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP443157
Oil Type: MOBIL HYDRAULIC OIL AW 46
Job No: 12058

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The condition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10876156Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 15 Feb 2024
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06088711 (Generated: 02/15/2024 10:14:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443157 VCP363758 VCP374802 VCP284642Sample Date 08 Feb 2024 11 Aug 2022 09 Aug 2022 10 Aug 2020Machine Hours 12796 10465 10465 11690Oil Hours 0 4000 4000 1500Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.9 42.7 42.6 43.3Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.42 0.42 0.33 0.493
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 7454 38177 24244 4315Particles >6µm 366 6014 4649 847Particles >14µm 20 252 215 40ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/16/11 22/20/15 22/19/15 19/17/12Silicon ppm 8 8 13 7Sodium ppm 3 3 1 2Potassium ppm 0 0 0 5
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 6 8 6Copper ppm 12 13 4 8Lead ppm 0 <1 0 2Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 2 2 <1Chromium ppm 1 1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 0Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 403 415 99 419Magnesium ppm 23 22 12 23Zinc ppm 593 538 460 532Phosphorus ppm 458 450 358 420Barium ppm 0 0 2 <1Boron ppm 8 11 0 8

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06088711 (Generated: 02/15/2024 10:14:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30D 12117\Hydraulic System [VCP443157] 08 Feb 2024 @ 12796.0 hrs

