
[[SWO069350]] VOLVO EC300ELR 311843 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP431841
Oil Type: VOLVO DTE 26
Job No: SWO069350

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of silt (particulates < 14microns in size) present in the oil. Theoil viscosity is lower than normal. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10876161Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 15 Feb 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06088716 (Generated: 02/15/2024 16:29:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP431841 VCP422329 VCP376426 VCP373112Sample Date 09 Feb 2024 22 Sep 2023 18 Jan 2023 17 Jun 2022Machine Hours 5843 5320 4507 3850Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 58.5 59.2 52.3 54.0Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.49 0.61 0.69 0.59
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 57640 23309 26753 105472Particles >6µm 10699 3282 5826 16872Particles >14µm 383 226 487 388ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/21/16 22/19/15 22/20/16 24/21/16Silicon ppm 5 4 3 5Sodium ppm 4 4 2 4Potassium ppm <1 1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 9 7 11Copper ppm 18 19 16 34Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 6 0 3 5Chromium ppm 4 3 2 3Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 1 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 105 93 88 83Magnesium ppm 5 3 4 4Zinc ppm 596 537 525 498Phosphorus ppm 396 382 376 386Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 0 0 0 3

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06088716 (Generated: 02/15/2024 16:29:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC300ELR 311843\Hydraulic System [VCP431841] 09 Feb 2024 @ 5843.0 hrs

