
[[SW0069350]] VOLVO EC300ELR 311843 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP430874
Oil Type: COWIN 80W90
Job No: SW0069350

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. There is atrace of moisture present in the oil.The oil is no longer serviceable dueto the presence of contaminants.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10876576Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 16 Feb 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06089131 (Generated: 02/16/2024 12:27:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP430874 VCP415146 VCP422345 VCP421750Sample Date 09 Feb 2024 06 Oct 2023 22 Sep 2023 21 Apr 2023Machine Hours 5843 5383 5320 4800Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status SEVERE NORMAL SEVERE SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 130 137 143 134
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.121 NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 333 22 625 456Sodium ppm 3 <1 11 15Potassium ppm 7 2 14 10
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 753 78 2471 1170Copper ppm 2 2 5 2Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 64 3 96 99Chromium ppm 11 <1 26 18Molybdenum ppm 19 20 8 8Nickel ppm 1 0 3 1Titanium ppm 6 <1 9 8Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 6 <1 17 11Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 267 281 212 240Magnesium ppm 78 85 34 46Zinc ppm 157 184 63 75Phosphorus ppm 1095 972 961 921Barium ppm 12 0 0 0Boron ppm 137 169 164 150

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06089131 (Generated: 02/16/2024 12:27:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC300ELR 311843\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP430874] 09 Feb 2024 @ 5843.0 hrs

