
[[661396]] VOLVO L110H 631024 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP438082
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 661396

HUBBARD CONSTRUCTION303 WEST LANDSTREET ROADORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: RAY BIRKOray.birko@hubbard.comT: (407)855-3535F: (407)857-1282
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: HUBORLUnique No: 10876580Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 15 Feb 2024
Report Id: HUBORL [WUSCAR] 06089135 (Generated: 02/15/2024 04:45:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RAY BIRKO - HUBORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP438082 VCP405130 VCP381264 VCP360964Sample Date 10 Feb 2024 18 Apr 2023 02 Nov 2022 18 Apr 2022Machine Hours 10869 9834 9345 8655Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.5 42.2 42.3 42.0
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 17 14 13 12Sodium ppm <1 4 4 9Potassium ppm 2 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 86 36 36 43Copper ppm 35 24 17 33Lead ppm <1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 1 1 1Chromium ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 2Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 2 <1 <1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4166 3739 3923 3807Magnesium ppm 21 18 17 23Zinc ppm 1642 1547 1594 1465Phosphorus ppm 1493 1270 1183 1293Barium ppm 12 0 0 0Boron ppm 152 135 138 140

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HUBORL [WUSCAR] 06089135 (Generated: 02/15/2024 04:45:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RAY BIRKO - HUBORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631024\Front Axle [VCP438082] 10 Feb 2024 @ 10869.0 hrs

