
[[661347 BCSW]] VOLVO A40G 352381 - BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP441974
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 661347 BCSW

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10876581Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 16 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06089136 (Generated: 02/16/2024 12:05:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441974 VCP399699 VCP376912 VCP336874Sample Date 07 Feb 2024 02 Mar 2023 15 Sep 2022 06 Dec 2021Machine Hours 7523 5782 4951 3414Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.3 42.4 39.6 39.8
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 18 17 18 19Sodium ppm 3 6 9 5Potassium ppm 1 <1 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 20 27 14 15Copper ppm 218 162 222 232Lead ppm 0 2 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 2 <1 1 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 0 <1Nickel ppm 6 6 6 7Titanium ppm <1 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 2 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2972 3101 3196 3508Magnesium ppm 10 12 7 6Zinc ppm 1379 1314 1417 1416Phosphorus ppm 1354 1105 1216 1319Barium ppm 12 0 0 0Boron ppm 82 77 94 115

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06089136 (Generated: 02/16/2024 12:05:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352381\Brake Cooling System [VCP441974] 07 Feb 2024 @ 7523.0 hrs

