
VOLVO EC480EL 314981 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP432036
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 30
Job No:

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Metal levels are typical fora new component breaking in. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10882781Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 16 Feb 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06089928 (Generated: 02/16/2024 15:29:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432036 VCP433870 VCP369463 VCP405900Sample Date 07 Feb 2024 23 Oct 2023 07 Aug 2023 07 Jun 2023Machine Hours 2922 2416 1929 1475Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.1 12.2 12.2 12.2Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.1 8.2 9.1 8.4Oxidation (PA) % 73 80 82 85
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 83 69 67 68Sulfation (PA) % 55 57 60 62Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 9 17 10 10Sodium ppm 1 3 0 3Potassium ppm 2 <1 1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 6 6 9Copper ppm 4 3 3 7Lead ppm 0 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 1Aluminum ppm 2 2 2 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 103 48 44 51Nickel ppm <1 2 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1346 1662 1673 1630Magnesium ppm 613 542 469 551Zinc ppm 907 951 894 988Phosphorus ppm 658 773 734 805Barium ppm 11 0 2 0Boron ppm 41 20 19 22

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06089928 (Generated: 02/16/2024 15:29:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 314981\Diesel Engine [VCP432036] 07 Feb 2024 @ 2922.0 hrs

