
[[SPM646500 AMG RES]] SENNEBOGEN 835M 835.0.2002 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP435730
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SPM646500 AMG RES

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. Oil and filter changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate amount of fuel present inthe oil. Test for glycol is negative. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10882793Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 20 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06089940 (Generated: 02/23/2024 11:19:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435730 VCP422573 VCP406720 VCP404076Sample Date 04 Jan 2024 07 Jul 2023 14 Apr 2023 18 Jan 2023Machine Hours 15647 8436 13746 12854Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL MARGINAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 15.1 15.2 11.6Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.4 8.2 6.4 8.0Oxidation (PA) % 116 131 152 106
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 1.3 1.3 1.6 0.9Nitration (PA) % 138 155 158 128Sulfation (PA) % 74 83 85 68Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 6.7 3.0 5.2 7.3Silicon ppm 9 7 7 6Sodium ppm 75 3 3 2Potassium ppm 27 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 63 91 89 58Copper ppm 2 3 3 2Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 4 4 5 3Chromium ppm 3 4 4 2Molybdenum ppm 76 75 63 57Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1048 1345 970 1034Magnesium ppm 1013 1220 926 876Zinc ppm 1277 1500 1144 1144Phosphorus ppm 895 1212 959 885Barium ppm 11 0 0 0Boron ppm 1 0 1 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06089940 (Generated: 02/23/2024 11:19:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835M 835.0.2002\Diesel Engine [VCP435730] 04 Jan 2024 @ 15647.0 hrs

